
 
 
 
 
 

 
COUNTY OF ALLEGHENY 

DIVISION OF PURCHASING AND SUPPLIES 
436 GRANT STREET 

ROOM 206 COURTHOUSE 
PITTSBURGH PA 15219 

  Inquiry No. RFQ-2935FA 
 

This Letter Agreement is made and entered into this 26th day of January, 2010.  In accordance with the 
specifications, terms, and conditions of Inquiry Number RFQ-2935FA, you  
 

Daniel H. Andre 
G/S Leasing Inc. 

3290 West Big Beaver, Suite 200 
Troy, MI 48084 

Phone:  248-649-5560  Fax:  248-649-1514 
dcyrus@gssolutions.com  

 
Agree to furnish, supply, or deliver to the County of Allegheny, the following goods and/or services: 
 

RENTAL OF COMPUTER TERMINAL EQUIPMENT 
 

Item # Description 
Monthly Rental 

Including Maintenance 
 
Group I – Controllers and Multiplexors 
 
1. McDATA 7100/90R Remote Controller or approved 

equal with 4 3270 ports. 
 

 $125.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID Model:  NO BID  
 

2. McDATA 7100/60R Remote Controller or approved 
equal with 32 3270 ports. 
 

 $200.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID Model:  NO BID  
 

3. McDATA 7100/20R Remote Controller or approved 
equal with 64 3270 ports. 
 

 $145.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID Model:  NO BID  
 

   
4. McDATA 4199 Coax Line Multiplexor or approved 

equal. 
 

 $20.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

5. McDATA 7100/10L Local Controller or approved equal 
with 64 3270 ports. 
 

 $255.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
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Item # 
 

Description 
 

Monthly Rental 
Including Maintenance 

 
6. McDATA 7100/11L Local Controller or approved equal 

with 64 3270 ports. 
 

 $85.00

Manufacturer:  IBM  Model:  3174-11L  
 

Group II – Terminals 
 
7. MOMENTUM TECHNOLOGIES 9278 Mod. 2 

Terminal/Keyboard or approved equal. 
 

 $13.00

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

8. MOMENTUM TECHNOLOGIES 9278 Mod. 5 
Terminal/Keyboard or approved equal. 
 

 $15.00

Manufacturer:  Idea Courrier  Model:  12471  
 

Group III – Printers 
 
9. MOMENTUM TECHNOLOGIES 9214 printer or 

approved equal. 
 

 $75.00 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

10. Tally Model T2155  Wide Carriage Continuous Printer 
or approved equal. 
 

 $125.00 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

11. Tally Model T2245  Wide Carriage Continuous Printer 
or approved equal. 
 

 $78.00 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

12. Tally Model 350 Coax Continuous Printer or approved 
equal. 
 

 $99.00 

Manufacturer:  Tally/Genicom  Model:  3860S  
 

13. Tally Model T2030/9 Dot Matrix Printer or approved 
equal. 
 

 $65.00 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

14. OUTPUT TECHNOLOGY CORP.  – Lasermatrix 
Printer or approved equal. 
 

 NO BID 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

15. Visioneer Model 924981 Strobe XP 200 Scanner or 
approved equal 
 

 $19.89 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
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Item # 
 

Description 
 

Monthly Rental 
Including Maintenance 

 
Group IV – Bar Code Readers 
 
16. Welch Allyn Bar Code Wedge Reader or approved 

equal. 
 

 $19.89 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

17. UBI Model 917 Coax Barcode Wedge Reader or 
approved equal. 
 

 $19.89 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

Group V – Coax Interface 
 
18. I/O Corporation Coax/3270 Printer Interface or 

approved equal. 
 

 $15.00 

Manufacturer:  NO BID  Model:  NO BID  
 

 
Period of Contract:  Two (2) years, February 1, 2010 through January 31, 2012 
 
DELIVER F.O.B. Point of Delivery 
 
OPTION TO EXTEND 
The Division of Purchasing and Supplies, reserves the right, upon notice to the supplier, to extend the Contract or any part 
of the Contract for up to three (3) months, upon the same terms and conditions after the indicated expiration date as 
described in the Contract.  This will be utilized to prevent a lapse in Contract coverage for the goods or services indicated 
on the Contract, and only for the time necessary to enter into a new Contract.  When applicable, an extension notice will be 
issued defining the exact extension of the Contract; all other terms and conditions of the extended Contract will remain in 
full force and effect. 
 
YOU ARE ADVISED NOT TO MAKE ANY DELIVERIES OF GOODS OR OTHERWISE BEGIN PERFORMANCE 
UNTIL EXPRESSLY DIRECTED.  Your performance, when it begins, shall conform to the terms of your quote and the 
County's Inquiry. 
 
Bidder agrees to make available to the Councils of Government, Municipalities, Authorities and School Districts within 
Allegheny County, all items contained in this inquiry at the price quoted for the entire Contract Period. 
  
Bidder agrees to make available to all political sub-division and authorities of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania all items 
contained in this inquiry at the price quoted for the entire Contract Period. 
 
The County retains the right to terminate this contract upon thirty (30) days written notice.  
 
This Letter Agreement is duly signed on the day and year first written above, by the party below, who intends to be legally 
bound hereby. 
 
 

_________________________________ 
        Frank Alessio III, CPPB 
 


